
BID TABULATION

Vastwood Park Sprayground - Contract No. 1 & 2 

ARCHITECT'S PROJECT NO. 23069

March 28, 2024

BIDDER
 Contract #1 
Sprayground

 Contract #2 
Restroom

Total Contract 
1&2

Lanham Base Bid $976,423.00 $413,971.00
Contingency $25,000.00 $25,000.00
Total $1,001,423.00 $438,971.00 $1,382,394.00

Danco Construction Base Bid No Bid No Bid
Contingency
Total $1,387,000.00

Parco Base Bid $520,900.00 No Bid
Contingency $25,000.00
Total $545,900.00

GN Excavating & Trucking Base Bid $1,019,684.24 $140,000.00 No Bid
Contingency $25,000.00 $25,000.00
Total $1,044,684.24 $165,000.00 $1,209,684.24
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